
Unraveling the Political History of the Tibetan
Institution of Reincarnation
The Tibetan institution of reincarnation is a fascinating and complex system
that has played a significant role in Tibetan history and culture for centuries.
This article will delve into the political history of this unique institution,
exploring its origins, evolution, and its impact on Tibetan society.

Origins and Development

The concept of reincarnation is deeply embedded in Tibetan Buddhism and
has its roots in the teachings of the Buddha himself. According to Buddhist
belief, all living beings are subject to a cycle of rebirth until they achieve
enlightenment. The Dalai Lama, the spiritual leader of Tibet, is believed to
be the embodiment of the Bodhisattva of Compassion, Avalokiteshvara.
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The practice of identifying reincarnations began in the 13th century when
the fifth Dalai Lama, Lobsang Gyatso, was recognized as the reincarnation
of his predecessor. This system was formalized in the 17th century by the
fifth Dalai Lama's regent, Desi Sangye Gyatso, who established a set of
rules and procedures for identifying and enthroning reincarnations.

Political Significance

The institution of reincarnation has had a profound impact on Tibetan
politics. The Dalai Lama, as the embodiment of Avalokiteshvara, has
traditionally been regarded as the political and spiritual leader of Tibet. This
dual role has given the Dalai Lama significant political power and influence.

The system of reincarnation has also been used to maintain the stability of
Tibetan society. By ensuring the continuity of leadership through the
identification of reincarnations, Tibet was able to avoid the political turmoil
and power struggles that often plagued other societies.

Chinese Intervention and the Search for the 11th Panchen Lama

In 1950, the People's Republic of China invaded Tibet, which marked a
watershed moment in the history of the institution of reincarnation. The
Chinese government has sought to exert control over the selection and
enthronement of reincarnations, seeing it as a means of asserting its
authority over Tibet.

The most notable example of this was the search for the 11th Panchen
Lama, the second highest-ranking lama in Tibetan Buddhism. In 1995, the
Dalai Lama recognized a boy named Gedhun Choekyi Nyima as the
reincarnation of the Panchen Lama. However, the Chinese government



rejected this recognition and instead installed its own candidate, Gyaltsen
Norbu.

Current Status and Controversies

Today, the institution of reincarnation remains a contentious issue between
the Tibetan government-in-exile and the Chinese government. The Tibetan
government-in-exile continues to recognize Gedhun Choekyi Nyima as the
11th Panchen Lama, while the Chinese government insists that Gyaltsen
Norbu is the legitimate reincarnation.

The Chinese government's interference in the system of reincarnation has
raised concerns about the religious freedom of Tibetans and the future of
Tibetan Buddhism. Some critics argue that the Chinese government's goal
is to erode the traditional authority of the Dalai Lama and undermine
Tibetan identity.

The political history of the Tibetan institution of reincarnation is a complex
and fascinating tale of power, tradition, and religious faith. From its origins
in the teachings of the Buddha to its current status under Chinese rule, the
system of reincarnations has played a significant role in shaping Tibetan
society and culture.

As the world continues to watch the unfolding events in Tibet, the institution
of reincarnation will undoubtedly remain a focal point of debate and
controversy. The future of this unique system is uncertain, but its enduring
legacy will continue to be a subject of study and fascination for years to
come.
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